State of Rhode Island and Providence Plantations
Department of Administration
Division of Purchases

RIVIP BIDDER CERTIFICATION COVER FORM
SECTION 1 - BIDDER INFORMATION

Bidder must be registered as a vendor on the RIVIP system at www.purchasing.ri.gov to submit a bid proposal.

Solicitation Number: 7549817A2
Solicitation Title: REGAN BUILDING RENOVATIONS (8 PAGES)

Bid Proposal Submission

Deadline Date & Time:  9/16/2015 10:30 AM
RIVIP Vendor ID #: 6755

Bidder Name: Tower Construction Corp.

Address: 288 Lincoln Avenue

Warwick , RI 02888

USA
Telephone: 401.943.0110
Fax: 401.944.4041
Contact Name: Estimating
Contact Title: Estimating
Contact Email: estimating@towerconstructioncorp.com

SECTION 2 —DISCLOSURES

Bidders must respond to every statement. Bid proposals submitted without a complete response may be deemed
nonresponsive.

Indicate “Y" (Yes) or “N" (No) for Disclosures 1-4, and if “Yes,” provide details below. Complete Disclosure 5. If the Bidder is publicly held, the Bidder
may provide owner information about only those stockholders, members, partners, or other owners that hold at least 10% of the record or beneficial
equity interests of the Bidder.

N 1. state whether the Bidder, or any officer, directer, manager, stockholder, member, partner, or other owner or principal of the Bidder
or any parent, subsidiary, or affiliate has been subject to suspension or debarment by any federal, state, or municipal govemmental
auth(:ritg. |or the subject of criminal prosecution, or convicted of a criminal offense within the previous 5 years. If “Yes,” provide
details below.

or any parent, subsidiary, or affiliate has had any contracts with a federal, state, or municipal governmental authority terminated for
any reason within the previous 5 years. If “Yes,” provide details below.

3. State whether the Bidder, or any officer, director, manager, stockholder, member, partner, or other owner or principal of the Bidder
or arn(l parent, subsidiary, or affiliate has been fined more than $5000 for violation(s) of any Rhode Island environmental law(s) by
the Rhode Island Department of Environmental Management within the previous 5 years. If “Yes,” provide details below.

N 2. State whether the Bidder, or any officer, director, manager, stockholder, member, partner, or other owner or principal of the Bidder
N
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N

4. State whether any officer, director, manager, stockholder, member, partner, or other owner or principal of the Bidder is serving or

has served within the past two calendar years as either an appointed or elected official of any state governmental authority or quasi-
public corporation, including without limitation, any entity created as a legisiative body or public or state agency by the genera!
assembly or constitution of this state.

5. List each officer, director, manager, stockholder, member, partner, or other owner or principal of the Bidder, and each intermediate

parent company and the ultimate parent company of the Bidder. For each individual, provide his or her name, business address,
rincipal cccupation, position with the Bidder, and the percentage of ownership, if any, he or she holds in the Bidder, and each
ﬁ\termedlate parent company and the ultimate parent company of the Bidder.

Disclosure details (continue on additional sheet if necessary): Salvatore Torregrossa - Pres ident

Salvatore Torrearossa - Vice President

Salvateore—Torregrossa—Treasurer
A Y

Salvartore TOrregrossa - Secretary

SECTION 3 —CERTIFICATIONS

Bidders must respond to every statement. Bid proposals submitted without a complete response may be deemed

nonresponsive.

Indicate "Y" (Yes) or “N"(No), and if “No,” provide delails below.

" THE BIDDER CERTIFIES THAT:
Y 1. The Bldder will Immediately disclose, in writing, to the State Purchasing Agent any potential cenflict of interest which may occur

2013-4

during the term of any contract awarded pursuant to this solicitation.

. The Bidder possesses all licenses and anyone who will perform any work will possess all licenses required by applicable federal,

state, and local law necessary to perform the requirements of any contract awarded pursuant to this solicitation and will maintain alf
required licenses during the term of any contract awarded pursuant to this solicitation. In the event that any required ficense shall
lapse or be restricted or suspended, the Bidder shall immediately notify the State Purchasing Agent in writing.

. The Bidder will maintain all required insurance during the term of any contract pursuant to this solicitation. In the event that any required

insurance shall lapse or be canceled, the Bidder will immediately notify the State Purchasing Agent in writing.

. The Bidder understands that falsification of any information in this bid proposal or failure to notify the State Purchasing Agent of any

changes in disclosures or certifications in this Bidder Cerlification may be grounds for suspension, debarment, andfor
prosecution for fraud.

. The Bidder has not paid and will not pay any bonus, commission, fee, gratuity, or other remuneration to any employee or official of

the State of Rhode Island or any subdlvisx)n of the State of Rhode Island or other governmental authority for the purpose of
obtaining an award of a contract pursuant to this soficitation. The Bldder further certifies that no bonus, commission, fee, gratuity, or
other remuneration has been or will be received from any third party or paid to any third party contingent on the award of a contract
pursuant to this solicitation.

. This bid proposal is not a collusive bid proposal. Neither the Bidder, nor any of its owners, stockholders, members, partners,

principals, directors, managers, officers, employees, or agents has in any way colluded, consrlred. or agreed, directly or Indirectly,
with any other bidder or person to submit a collusive bid proposal in response to the solicitation or to refrain from submitting a bid
proposal in response to the solicitation, or has In any manner, directly or indirectly, sought by agreement or collusion or other
communication with any other bidder or person to fix the price or prices in the bid proposal or the bid proposal of any other bidder,
or tq fix any overhead, profit, or cost component of the bid price in the bid proposal or the bid proposal of any other bidder, or to
secure through any collusion, conspiracy, or unlawful agreement any advantage against the State of Rhode sland or any person
with an interest in the contract awarded pursuant to this solicitation. “The bid price in the bid proposal is fair and proper and is not
tainted by any collusion, conspiracy, or unlawful agreement on the part of the Bidder, its owners, stockholders, members, partners,
principals, directors, managers, officers, employees, or agents,

. The Bidder. (i) is not identified on the Genera!l Treasurer's list created pursuant to R.l. Gen. Laws § 37-2.5-3 as a person or entity

engaging in investment activities in lran described in § 37-2.5-2(b); and (ii) is not engaging in any such investment activities in Iran.

. The Bidder will comply with all of the laws that are incorporated into and/or applicable to any contract with the State of Rhode Island.
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Submission by the Bidder of a bid proposal pursuant to this solicitation constitutes an offer to contract with the
State of Rhode Island through the Division of Purchases on the terms and conditions contained in this
solicitation and the bid proposal. The Bidder certifies that: (1) the Bidder has reviewed this solicitation and
agrees to comply with its terms and conditions; (2) the bid proposal is based on this solicitation; and (3) the
information submitted in the bid proposal (including this RIVIP Bidder Certification Cover Form) is accurate and
complete. The Bidder acknowledges that the terms and conditions of this solicitation and the bid proposal will
be incorporated into any contract awarded to the Bidder pursuant to this solicitation and the bid proposal. The
person signing below represents, under penalty of perjury, that he or she is fully informed regarding the
preparation and contents of this bid proposal and has been duly authorized to execute and submit this bid
proposal on behalf of the Bidder.

BIDDER

Tower Construction Corp.

Name of Bidd:ré&}?
> -

Signatureinink
Salvatore Torregrossa President
Printed name and title of person signing on behalf of Bidder

Date: September 16, 2015
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Solicitation: #7549817

Solicitation Title: Regan Building Renovations

BID FORM
To: The State of Rhode Island Department of Administration
Division of Purchases, 2" Floor
One Capito! Hill, Providence, Rl 02908-5855
Project: Penthouse and Roof Renovations
Regan Building #60
111 Howard Avenue, Cranston, Rhode Island
Bidder:

Tower Construction Corp
Legal name of entity

288 Lincoln Avenue Warwick, RI 02888
Address (Street/City/State/Zip)

Salvatore Torregrossa estimating@towerconstructioncorp.com

Contact name Contact email
401.943.0110 401.944.4041
Contact telephone Contact fax

1. BASE BID PRICE

The Bidder submits this bid proposal to perform all of the work (including labor and materials) as

described in the solicitation for this Base Bid Price, (including the costs for all Allowances,
Bonds, and Addenda):

$ 314,400.00

(Base Bid Price in figures printed electronically, typed, or handwritten legibly in ink)

--Three Hundred'Fourteen Thousand Four Hundred and 00/100 Dollars--

(Base Bid Price in words electronically, typed, or handwritten legibly in ink)
° ALLOWANCES

The Base Bid Price jncludes the costs for the following Allowances:
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Solicitation: #7549817

Solicitation Title: Regan Building Renovations

1. Premium Time $15,000.00
2. Roof Drain Piping $10,000.00
3. Tele/data/Communications $5,000.00
Total Allowances: $30, 000.00

e BONDS

The Base Bid Price includes the costs for all Bid and Payment and Performance
Bonds required by the solicitation.

e ADDENDA

The Bidder has examined the entire solicitation (including the following Addenda),
and the Base Bid Price includes the costs of any modifications required by the
Addenda.

All Addenda must be acknowledged.

Addendum No. 1, dated  September 3, 2015

Addendum No. 2, dated = September 10, 2015

Addendum No. 3, dated kbt
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Solicitation: #7549817

Solicitation Title: Regan Building Renovations
2. ALTERNATES (Additions to Base Bide Price)

The Bidder offers to: (i) perform the work described in these Alternates as selected by the State
in the order of priority specified below, based on the availability of funds and the best interest of
the State; and (ji) increase the Base Bid Price by the amount set forth below for each Alternate
selected. Refer to section 01 23 00 for complete description of alternates.

ADD ALTERNATE NUMBER ONE

REMOVE AND DISPOSE OF EXISTING EPDM ROOFING SYSTEM DOWN TO EXISTING

CONCRETE ROOF DECK. PROVIDE AND INSTALL NEW EPDM ROOFING SYSTEM. SEE
SHADED AREA ON DRAWING A1.00.

$ 75,000.00

(Amount in figures printed electronically, typed, or handwritten legibly in ink)

--Seventy-Five Thousand and 00/100 Dollars --

(Amount in words electronically, typed, or handwritten legibly in ink)

3. UNIT PRICES
Unit Prices Not Used

4. CONTRACT TIME

The Bidder offers to perform the work in accordance with the timeline specified below:

o Start of CONSIIUCHON.......coviieieitiieee et eeee et e e October 14, 2015
¢ Mechanical Penthouse Weathertight.................coooevvevvreneininnis November 15, 2015
o Elevator Penthouse Weathertight...........................ccvveenee...o......December 15,2015
o Substantial Completion.............cceverreeeviereeesieetteee e e e eneeaaas January 31, 2015
o Final Completion ............cceiieeieiieceece et er e February 10, 2016
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Solicitation: #7549817

Solicitation Title: Regan Building Renovations

The Final Completion date for Work shall be within 120 calendar days of the Purchase Order
from the Division of Purchases.

5. LIQUIDATED DAMAGES

The successful bidder awarded a contract pursuant to this solicitation shall be liable for and pay
the State, as liquidated damages and not as a penalty, the following amount for each calendar

day of delay beyond the date for substantial completion, as determined in the sole discretion of
the State: Five Hundred Dollars ($500.00) per day.

This bid proposal is irrevocable for 60 days from the bid proposal submission deadline.

If the Bidder is determined to be the successful bidder pursuant to this solicitation, the
bidder will promptly: (i) comply with each of the requirements of the Tentative Letter of
Award; and (ii) commence and diligently pursue the work upon issuance and receipt of
the purchase order from the State and authorization from the user agency.

The person signing below certifies that he or she has been duly authorized to execute
and submit this bid proposal on behalf of the Bidder.

BIDDER
Date: September 16, 2015

Tower Construction Corp
‘-..\_

Name of Bidde g =\
L
Signature in ink
Salvatore Torregrossa - President

Printed name and title of person signing on behalf of Bidder

# 1387

Bidder's Contractor Registration Number
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THE AMERICAN INSTITUTE OF ARCHITECTS

AIA Document A310

Bid Bond

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS, that we ~ Tower Construction Corp.

288 Lincoln Ave., Warwick, Rl 02886 ) .
as Principal, hereinafter called the Principal, and North American Specialty Insurance Company

650 Elm Street, Manchester, NH 03101
a corporation duly organized under the laws of State of NH

as Surety, hereinafter called the Surety, are held and firmly bound unto

State of Rhode Island and Providence Plantations

One Capitol Hill, Providence, Rl 02908

as Obligee, hereinafter called the Obligee, in the sum of

Five Percent of Amount Bid Dollars (§ 5% )s

for the payment of which sum well and truly to be made, the said Principal and the said Surety, bind ourselves, our heirs,
executors, administrators, successors and assigns, jointly and severally, firmly by these presents.

WHEREAS, the Principal has submitted a bid for

Project #7549817 Regan Building Renovations

NOW, THEREFORE, if the Obligee shall accept the bid of the Principal and the Principal shall enter into a Contract with
the Obligee in accordance with the terms of such bid, and give such bond or bonds as may be specified in the bidding or
Contract Documents with good and sufficient surety for the faithful performance of such Contract and for the prompt
payment of labor and material furnished in the prosecution hereof, or in the event of the failure of the Principal to enter
such Contract and give such bond or bonds, if the Principal shall pay to the Obligee the difference not to exceed the penalty
hereof between the amount specified in said bid and such larger amount for which the Obligee may in good faith contract
with another party to perform the Work covered by said bid, then this obligation shall be null and void, otherwise to remain

in full force and effect.

Signed and sealed this 16th  of September , 2015

Tower Construction Corp.
“Mardir S at (Principa) SeaD

U M

Salvatore Torregrod$ifl) President s
o,

24
/" jd/ i North American Specialty Insurance Company §, D\\Poaqf :’e
y/AV, urcty) =57 o9eal)izz
/ (Witness) LY IS?J o
,:'I'; %‘E&ﬁ ‘\Q- 5’3.::
f BY _Mut 22, e

( \( Shelly L. Andfade (T“’e) Attorney\n Fact g™

AIA DOCUMENT A310 « BID BOND » AIA® » FEBRUARY 1970 ED »
THE AMERICAN INSTITUTE OF ARCHITECTS, 1735 N.Y. AVE., N.W., WASHINGTON, D.C. 20006
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NAS SURETY GROUP

NORTH AMERICAN SPECIALTY INSURANCE COMPANY
WASHINGTON INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE COMPANY

GENERAL POWER OF ATTORNEY

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS, THAT North American Specialty Insurance Company, a corporation duly organized and existing under

laws of the State of New Hampshire, and having its principal office in the City of Manchester, New Hampshire, and Washington International Insurance
Company, a corporation organized and existing under the laws of the State of New Hampshire and having its principal office in the City of Schaumburg
Illinois each does hereby make, constitute and appoint: Shelly I.. Andrade

Its true and lawful Attorney-in-Fact, to make, execute, seal and deliver, for and on its behalf and as its act and deed, the following surety bond:

Principal: Tower Construction Corp. Bond Number: Bid Bond
Obligee: State of Rhode Island and Providence Plantations Bond Amount: See Bond Form

Bond Description: Project #7549817 Regan Building Renovations

Provided that no bond or undertaking or contract of surctyship cxccuted under this authority shall cxceed the amount of:
FIFTY MILLION ($50,000,000) DOLLARS

This Power of Attorney is granted and is signed by facsimile under and by the authority of the following Resolutions adopted by the Boards of
Directors of both North American Specialty Insurance Company and Washington International Insurance Company at meetings duly called and held on
the 9" of May, 2012:

“RESOLVED, that any two of the Presidents, any Managing Director, any Senior Vice President, any Vice President, any Assistant Vice President,
the Secretary or any Assistant Sccretary be, and each or any of them hereby is authorized to execute a Power of Attorney qualifying the attoney named in
the given Power of Attorney to execute on behalf of the Company bonds, undertakings and all contracts of surety, and that each or any of them hereby is
authorized to attest to the execution of any such Power of Attorney and to attach therein the seal of the Company; and it is

FURTHER RESOLVED, that the signature of such officers and the seal of the Company may be affixed to any such Power of Attorney or to any
certificate relating thereto by facsimile, and any such Power of Attorey or certificate bearing such facsimile signatures or facsimile seal shall be
binding upon the Company when so affixed and in the future with regard to any bond, undertaking or contract of surety to which it is attached.”

Ny, %Z_Z_____
SRty 4, By

......... %,
.bbh?dhq?(/ ,”g Steven P. Anderson, Senlor Vice President of Washington Intemational Insurance Company
s 32z & Senlor Vice President of North American Specialty I C

§§. 2%

£d¢ SEAL :i8E2 .

3 R Loam

%, By %‘% i“‘ ——

‘9("5....- David M. Layman, Vice President of, ington Intemational Insurance Company
tean Cneciatiy T P

90N + W\ i
a’”lﬂmlm\”“‘\ & Vice of North A pecialty pany

S

R
g
AN

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, North American Specialty Insurance Company and Washington International Insurance Company have caused their
official seals to be hereunto affixed, and these presents to be signed by their authorized officers this _25th_day of _May 2012.

North American Specialty Insurance Company
Washington International Insurance Company

State of Illinois .
County of Cook 5%

On this_25th day of __May _ 20 12 , before me, a Notary Public personally appeared Steven P. Anderson Senior Vice President of
Washington International Insurance Company and Senior Vice President of North American Specialty Insurance Company and  David M. Layman
Vice President of Washington International Insurance Company and Vice President of North American Specialty Insurance Company, personally
known to me, who being by me duly swomn, acknowledged that they signed the above Power of Attorney as officers of and acknowledged said
instrument to be the voluntary act and deed of their respective companies.

{“OFFICIAL SEAL” }\Qmww /0 M'O

{DONNA D, SKLENS
{Notary Public, State of Lllinois Donna D. Sklens, Notary Public

§My Commission Expires 10/05/2015

-

.

I, Jeffrey Goldberg _ , the duly elected Assistant Secretary of North American Specialty Insurance Company and Washington
International Insurance Company, do hereby certify that the above and foregoing is a true and correct copy of a Power of Attorney given by said North
American Specialty Insurance Company and Washington International Insurance Company, which is still in full force and effect.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have set my hand and affixed the seals of the Companies this 16th day of __September 2015

) i

Jeffrey Goldberg, Vice President & Assistant Secretary of Washington Intemational Insurance Company &
Assi: S y of North American Specialty I Company




STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

Department of Labor and Trainin,
Center General Complex

Cranston, RI 02920-4407

Charles J, Fogarty
Dlrector

STATE CONTRACT ADDENDUM
RHODE ISLAND DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND TRAINING

PREVAILING WAGE REQUIREMENTS
(37-13-1 ET SEQ.)

The prevailing wage requirements are generally set forth in RIGL 37-13-1 et seq. These
requirements refer to the prevailing rate of pay for regular, holiday, and overtime wages
to be paid to each craftsmen, mechanic, teamster, laborer, or other type of worker
performing work on public works projects when state or municipal funds exceed one
thousand dollars ($1,000).

I. Submit to the Awarding Authority a list of the contractor’s subcontractors for any
part or all of the prevailing wage work in accordance with RIGL § 37-13-4;

2. Pay all prevailing wage employees at least once per week and in accordance with
RIGL §37-13-7 (see Appendix B attached);

3. Post the prevailing wage rate scale and the Department of Labor and Training’s
prevailing wage poster in a prominent and easily accessible place on the work site
in accordance with RIGL §37-13-11; posters may be downloaded at
www.dlt.ri.gov/pw/Posters.htm .poster/htm or obtained from the Department of Labor

and Training, Center General Complex, 1511 Pontiac Avenue, Cranston, Rhode
Island;

4. Access the Department of Labor and Training website, at www.dlt.ri.gov on or
before July 1stof each year, until such time as the contract is completed, to
ascertain the current prevailing wage rates and the amount of payment or
contributions for each covered prevailing wage employee and make any necessary

adjustments to the covered employee's prevailing wage rates effective July Ia of
each year in compliance with RIGL §37-13-8;

5. Attach a copy of this CONTRACT ADDENDUM and its attachments as a
binding obligation to any and all contracts between the contractor and any

1511 Pontize Avenuo TTY: Via RI Relay 711

An Equal Opportunity Employer/Program./Auxillary alds and services are avallable upon request to individuals with disabilitles.
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STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

Department of Labor and Training

Center General Complex Telephone;  (401) 462-8000
1511 Pontlac Avenue TTY; Via RI Relay 711
Cranston, RI 02920-4407

subcontractors and their assignees for prevailing wage work performed pursuant
to this contract;

6. Provide for the payment of overtime for prevailing wage employees who work in
excess of eight (8) hours in any one day or forty (40) hours in any one week as
provided by RIGL §37-13-10;

7. Maintain accurate prevailing wage employee payroll records on a Rhode Island
Certified Weekly Payroll form available for download at
www.dlt.ri.gov/pw.forms/htm, as required by RIGL §37-13-13, and make those
records available to the Department of Labor and Training upon request;

8. Furnish the fully executed RI Certified Weekly Payroll Form to the awarding
authority on a monthly basis for all work completed in the preceding month.

9. For general or primary contracts one million dollars ($1,000,000) or more, shall
maintain on the work site a fully executed RI Certified Prevailing Wage Daily
Log listing the contractor's employees employed each day on the public works
site; the RI Certified Prevailing Wage Daily Log shall be available for inspection
on the public works site at all times; this rule shall not apply to road, highway, or
bridge public works projects. Where applicable, furnish both the Rhode Island
Certified Prevailing Wage Daily Log together with the Rhode Island Weekly
Certified Payroll to the awarding authority.

10. Assure that all covered prevailing wage employees on construction projects with a
total project cost of one hundred thousand dollars ($100,000) or more has a

OSHA ten (10) hour construction safety certification in compliance with RIGL §
37-23-1;

11. Employ apprentices for the performance of the awarded contract when the
contract is valued at one million dollars ($1,000,000) or more, and comply with
the apprentice to journeyperson ratio for each trade approved by the

apprenticeship council of the Department of Labor and Training in compliance
with RIGL §37-13-3.1;

12. Assure that all prevailing wage employees who perform work which requires a

Rhode Island trade license possess the appropriate Rhode Island trade license in
compliance with Rhode Island law; and

An Equal Opportunity Employer/Program. /Auxillary alds and services are available upon request to individuals with disabllitles,
TTYvia Rf Retay 711

2013-17
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STATE OF RHODE [SLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

Department of Labor and Training
Center General Complex

Cranston, RI 02920-4407

Lincoln D. Chafes
Governor

Charles J, Foparty

An Equal Opporwunity Employer/Program, /Auxiliary alds and services are

2013-17

Director

13. Comply with all applicable provisions of RIGL §37-13-1, et. seq;

Any questions or concerns regarding this CONTRACT ADDENDUM should be
addressed to the contractor or subcontractor's attorney. Additional Prevailing Wage

information may be obtained from the Departiment of Labor and Training at
www.dlt.ri.gov/pw.

CERTIFICATION

I hereby certify that I have reviewed this CONTRACT ADDENDUM and
understand my obligations as stated above.

.

Salvatore Torregrossa
Title: President

Subscribed and sworn before me this 1 6day orSept , 2015

m/](k/uég 7 EREL 4 gmiff?\

Notary Public( Maril¢hn J. Smith
My commissi‘éi;] expires: JU{Y 4, 2017

—

TTY via RI Relay 711
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STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

Department of Labor and Training

Center General Complex Telephone:  (401) 462-8060
1511 Pontlac Avenue

Cransten, Rl 02920-4407

APPENDIX A

TITLE 37
Public Property and Works

CHAPTER 37-13
Labor and Payment of Debts by Contractors

SECTION 37-13-5

§37-13-5 Payment for trucking or materials furnished - Withholding of sums
due, -A contractor or subcontractor on public works authorized by a proper authority
shall pay any obligation or charge for trucking and material which have been furnished
for the use of the contractor or subcontractor, in connection with the public works being
performed by him or her, within ninety (90) days after the obligation or charge is incurred
or the trucking service has been performed or the material has been delivered to the site
of the work, whichever is later. When it is brought to the notice of the proper authority in
a city or town, or the proper authority in the state having supervision of the contract, that
the obligation or charge has not been paid by the contractor or subcontractor, the proper
authority may deduct and hold for a period not exceeding sixty (60) days, from sums of
money due to the contractor or subcontractor, the equivalent amount of such sums
certified by a trucker or materialman creditor as due him or her, as provided in this

section, and which the proper authority determines is reasonable for trucking performed
or materials furnished for the public works.

2013-17 Pagedof? 9-12:2013
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APPRENDIX B

TITLE 37
Public Property and Works

CHAPTER 37-13
Labor and Payment of Debts by Contractors

SECTION 37-13-7

§37-13-7 Specification in contract of amount and frequency of payment of wages.
~(@) Every call for bids for every contract in excess of one thousand dollars ($1,000), to
which the state of Rhode Island or any political subdivision thereofor any public agency
orquasi-public agency is a party, for construction, alteration, and/or repair, including
painting and decorating, of public buildings or public works of the state of Rhode Island
or any political subdivision thereof, orany public agency or quasi-public agency and
which requires orinvolves the employment of employees, shall contain aprovision
stating the minimum wages to be paid various types of employees which shall be based
upon the wages that will be determined by the director of labor and training to be
prevailing forthe corresponding types of employees employed on projects of a character
similar to the contract work in the city, town, village, or other appropriate political
subdivision oftthe state of Rhode Island in which the work is to be performed. Every
contract shall contain a stipulation that the contractor or his or her subcontractor shall pay
all the employees employed directly upon the site of the work, unconditionally and not
less often than once a week, and without subsequent deduction or rebate on any account,
the full amounts accrued at time of payment computed at wage rates not less than those
stated in the call for bids, regardless of any contractual relationships which may be
alleged to exist between the contractor or subcontractor and the employees, and that the

+ scale of wages to be paid shall be posted by the contractor in a prominent and easily

accessible place at the site of the work; and the further stipulation that there may be
withheld from the contractor so much of the accrued payments as may be considered
necessary to pay to the employees employed by the contractor, or any subcontractor on
the work, the difference between the rates of wages required by the contract to be paid
the employees on the work and the rates of wages received by the employees and not
refunded to the contractor, subcontractors, or their agents,

(b) The terms “wages", "scale of wages", "wage rates", "minimum wages", and
“prevailing wages" shall include;

(1) The basic hourly rate of pay; and
(2) The amount of:

PageSof7
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(A) The rate of contribution made by a contractor or subcontractor to a trustee or to a
third person pursuant to a fund, plan, or program; and

(B) The rate of costs to the contractor or subcontractor which may be reasonably
anticipated in providing benefits to employees pursuant to an enforceable commitment to
carry out a financially responsible plan or program which was communicated in writing
to the employees affected, for medical or hospital care, pensions on retirement or death,
compensation for injuries or illness resulting from occupational activity, or insurance to
provide any of the foregoing, for unemployment benefits, life insurance, disability and
sickness insurance, or accident insurance, for vacation and holiday pay, for defraying
costs of apprenticeship or other similar programs, or for other bona fide fringe benefits,
but only where the contractor or subcontractor is not required by other federal, state, or
local. law to provide any of the benefits; provided, that the obligation of a contractor or
subcontractor to make payment in accordance with the prevailing wage determinations of
the director of labor and training insofar as this chapter of this title and other acts
incorporating this chapter of this title by reference are concerned may be discharged by
the making of payments in cash, by the making of contributions of a type referred to in
subsection (b)(2), or by the assumption of an enforceable commitment to bear the costs of
aplan or program of a type referred to in this subdivision, or any combination thereof,
where the aggregate of any payments, contributions, and costs is not less than the rate of
pay described in subsection (b)(1) plus the amount referred to in subsection (b)(2).

(c) The term "employees”, as used in this section, shall include employees of
contractors or subcontractors performing jobs on various types of public works including
mechanics, apprentices, teamsters, chauffeurs, and laborers engaged in the transportation
of gravel or fill to the site of public works, the removal and/or delivery of gravel or fill or
ready-mix concrete, sand, bituminous stone, or asphalt flowable fill from the site of
public works, or the transportation or removal of gravel or fill from one location to
another on the site of public works, and the employment of the employees shall be
subject to the provisions of subsections (a) and (b).

(d) The terms “public agency" and “quasi-public agency" shall include, but not be
limited to, the Rhode Island industrial recreational building authority, the Rhode Island
economic development corporation, the Rhode Island airport corporation, the Rhode

Island industrial facilities corporation, the Rhode Island refunding bond authority, the

Rhode Island housing and mortgage finance corporation, the Rhode Island resource
recovery corporation, the Rhode Island public transit authority, the Rhode Island student
loan authority, the water resources board corporate, the Rhode Island health and
education building corporation, the Rhode Island higher education assistance authority,
the Rhode Island turnpike and bridge authority, the Narragansett Bay water quality
management district commission, Rhode Island telecommunications authority, the
convention center authority, the board of governors for higher education, the board of
regents for elementary and secondary education, the capital center commission, the
housing resources commission, the Quonset Point-Davisville management corporation,
the Rhode Island children's crusade for higher education, the Rhode Island depositors
economic protection corporation, the Rhode Island lottery commission, the Rhode Island
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partnership for science and technology, the Rhode Island
the Rhode Island underground storage tank board.
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Regan Building Renovations- Minorities by Alpha

Regan Building Renovations- Minorities by Alpha

[Company |Minority [ Invited | 2nd Reminder | 3rd Reminder | 4th Reminder [Bid Received/No Bid Received |
Smartbid Smartbid Smartbid Smartbid

3D Construction, LLC DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
ABC Soils, Inc. DBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
ABM Enterprises DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Acme Abatement Contractor, Inc, DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Aid Kitchen Cabinets, Inc. DBE, MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Alpha Omega Construction, Inc. MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Altus Metal & Marble Services, Inc. DBE, MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
American Painting & Restoration, LLC DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Atlantic Bay Contracting Co., Inc. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
B. Baptista Electric, Inc. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Baker Steel Detailing MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Bay State Restoration, Ltd. DBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Berkshire Concrete Cutting, LLC DBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Berkshire Industrial Services, LLC DBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
C & D Industrial, Inc. DBE, MIBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 Bid Received
C.A.L. Restoration, Inc. MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
C.V.D. Paving Corporation DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Cardoso Construction, LLC DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
CNA Construction Services, Inc. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Cobble Hill Landscaping & Constructic DBE, MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Concrete Designs WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Construction Proformance,Inc. MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Cosco, Inc. DBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Crack Sealing, Inc. MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Cumplido Industries, Inc. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
D. Clifford Construction Co., Inc. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
D.P. Masonry MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Debnor Flooring DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Design Fabricators DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Desperini Contracting Group, Inc. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Duarte Corporation DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
E D M Construction, Inc. MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
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Eddy Soto Construction DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Equality Construction Works, Inc. MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
F.C. Construction Corp. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Ferreira's Concrete Forms, Inc. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Firex DBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
General Environmental Services, Inc. MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Go Green Services, LLC MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Great In Counters, Inc. MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Guwoe Home Improvement & Remod DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
H & S Environmental, Inc. MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
H. Thomas Associates, Inc. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
H.S.1. Construction, Inc. WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
HB Welding, Inc. MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Heroica's Painting, Inc. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
| Plus Enterprize, LLC DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Indoor Air Technologies, Inc. MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
International Building Corporation  DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
International Paving Corp. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Iron Lady Enterprises, Inc. MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
J & D Drywall DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
J & J Construction Architectural Wooc DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
J & J General Contractor, LLC DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
J. Albanese Construction MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Janet A. Bahry, d.b.a Simple Things  MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
JC Electric Inc. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
JM Painting & Plastering LLC DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
JMB Mechanical, Inc. MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Kay-Cor Contractors, Inc. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Kormex Metal Craft, Inc. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Lemoi Erectors, Inc. DBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
LMP Construction, Inc. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Love-R-Cleaning & Construction, LLC MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
M-O-N Landscaping, Inc. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
M. Barboza & Sons Roofing & Sheet N DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Marathon Industries, Inc. MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
MC Electrical Contractor, LLC DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
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Medeiros Hydro Seeding & Landscape DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Melanie Aldrich and Son Plumbing MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Melo's Rodbusters, Inc. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Metro USA Fire Protection, Inc. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Midwest Building Supplies, Inc. DBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Mill City Environmental Corporation DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Miller Mechanical, Inc DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Mt. Hope Builders DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
New England Highway Technologies, |DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Oak Hill Farm, LLC WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Pawtucket Asphalt Corporation DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Process Engineers & Constructors, Inc DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
R & R Electric DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
R.T. Nunes & Sons Inc. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Ravin Steel, Inc. MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Rhode Island Rebar, Inc. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
River City Drywall, LLC DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Rough & Ready Construction, LLC DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
S. Francisco Construction, Inc. WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
S.R. Painting and Remodeling, LLC DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Seacoast Masonry Supply, LLC MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Service Contracting, Inc. MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Site Tech Corporation DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Sitecon Corp MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
South Dartmouth Construction, Inc. MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Structural Stone, LLC WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
T & C Woodworking Inc. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
T&T Steel Erectors, Inc. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
T.M. Masonry, Inc. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Tandem Flooring, LLC DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Tantara Associates Corporation MBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Tavares, LLC DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Tele-Networks DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
The Sign Shoppe, LLC WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Touisset Custom Concrete, LLC DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Trakar Woodworks WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
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True Quality Construction, LLC DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
Tyler Electrical Services, Inc. DBE, WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
United Stone and Site, Inc. DBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Universal Insulation DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
V & L Construction DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Wallace Construction Corp. WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Wilkem Scientific Limited WBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015 No Bid Received
William Anthony Excavation, Inc. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Wonderwall Construction DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
Wood and Wire Fence Co. DBE, MBE 9/3/2015 9/8/2015 9/10/2015 9/15/2015  No Bid Received
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