Bid/RFPNumber:
Bid/RFP Title:

Opening Date & Time:

RIVIP Vendor ID #:
Vendor Name:

State of Rhode Island and Providence Plantations Contract Offer

RIVIP BIDDER CERTIFICATION COVER FORM

SECTION 1 - VENDOR INFORMATION

7548537

REPLACEMENT OF DOORS & RELATED HARDWARE - DOA (25 PGS)

4/25/2014
4017

Independent Hardware Inc.

Address: 14 South Front Street
Philadelphia, PA 19106-3001
USA

Telephone: (215) 925-5306

Fax: 215-922-6552

E-Mail: VZE2RKXK@VERIZON.NET

Contact Person: Frank Stanco

Title: President

11:00 AM

R.l. Foreign Corp #:

NOTICE TO VENDORS

Each bid proposal for a public works project must include a "public copy" to be available for public
inspection upon the opening of bids. Bid proposals that do not include a copy for public inspection will

be deemed nonresponsive. For further information on how to comply with this statutory requirement, see
R. 1. Gen. Laws §§ 37-2-18(b) and (j). Also see Procurement Regulation 5.11, and in addition, for highway
and bridge projects, also see Procurement Regulation 5.13, accessible at www.purchasing.ri.gov.

NOTE: AWARD OF CONTRACTS AND PURCHASE ORDERS SHALL BE SUBJECT, AT THE DISCRETION OF
THE PURCHASING AGENT, TO THE OFFEROR COMPLETING AN ON-LINE RIVIP REGISTRATION at
www.purchasing.ri.gov. Itis THE RESPONSIBILITY OF THE VENDOR to make on-line corrections/updates using
the Vendor maintenance program on the RI Division of Purchases Web Site.

SECTION 2 - REQUIREMENTS

ALL OFFERS ARE SUBJECT TO THE REQUIREMENTS, PROVISIONS AND PROCEDURES CONTAINED IN THIS
CERTIFICATION FORM. Offerors are expected to READ, SIGN and COMPLY WITH all requirements. Failure to do so
may be grounds for disqualification of the offer contained herein.
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Section 2.1 - RULES FOR SUBMITTING OFFERS

2.1A. This CERTIFICATION FORM MUST BE ATTACHED IN ITS ENTIRETY TC THE FRONT OF THE OFFER and shall be considered an integral part of
each offer made by a vendor to enter into a confract with the State of Rhode Island, Division of Purchases. As such, submittal of the entire Bidder
Centification Cover Form, signed by a duly authorized representative of the offeror attesting that hefshe (1) has read and agrees to comply with the
requirements set forth herein and (2) to the accuracy of the information provided and the offer extended, is a mandatory part of any contract award.

To assure that offers are considered on time, each offer must be submitted with the specific Bid/RFP/LOI number (provided above) and the date and time of
opening marked in the upper left hand corner of envelope. Each bid/offer must be submitted in separate sealed envelopes.

A complete, signed (in ink) offer package must be delivered to the Division of Purchases (via any mail or messenger service) by the time and date specified
for the opening of responses in a sealed envelope.

Bids must be submitted on the RI bid solicitation forms provided, indicating brand and part numbers of items offered, as appropriate. Bidders must submit
detailed cuts and specs on items offered as equivalent to brands requested WITH THE OFFER. Bidders must be able to submit samples if requested.
Mail To: Division of Purchases, One Capitol Hill, Second Floor, Providence, RI 02908-5855.

Documents misdirected to other State locations or which are not present in the Division of Purchases at the time of opening for whatever cause will be
deemed to be late and will not be considered. For the purposes of this requirement, the official time and date shalt be that of the time clock in the Division of
Purchases. Postmarks shall not be cansidered proof of timely submission.

2.1B. RIVIP SOLICITATIONS. To assure maximum access opportunities for users, public bid/RFP solicitations shall be posted on the RIVIP for a minimum
of seven days and no amendmants shall be made within the last five days before the date an offer is due. Except when access to the Web Site has been
severely curtaited and it is determined by the State Purchasing Agent that special circumstances preclude extending a solicitation due date, requests to mail
or fax hard copies of solicitations will not be honored. When the result of an Internet solicitation is unsuccessful, the State of Rhode Island will cancel the
original solicitation and resolicit the original offer directly from vendors.

2.2. PRICING. Offers are irrevocable for sixty (60) days from the opening date {or such cther extended period set forth in the solicitation) and may not be
withdrawn, except with the express permission of the State Purchasing Agent. All pricing will be considered to be firm and fixed unless otherwise indicated.
The State of Rhode Island is exempt from Federal excise taxes and State Sales and Use Taxes. Such taxes shall not be included in the bid price. PRICES
QUOTED ARE FOB DESTINATION.

2.3. DELIVERY and PRODUCT QUALITY. Alf offers must define delivery dates for all items; if no delivery date is specified, it is assumed that immediate
delivery from stock will be made. The contractor will be responsible for delivery of materials in first class condition. Rejected materials will be at vendor's
expense.

2.4. PREVAILING WAGE, OSHA SAFETY TRAINING, and APPRENTICESHIP REQUIREMENTS.

Bidders must comply with the provisions of the Rhode island labor laws, including R. 1. Gen. Laws §§ 37-13-1 et seq. and occupational safety laws, including
R. I. Gen. Laws §§ 28-20-1 ef seq. These laws mandate for public works construction projects the payment of prevailing wage rates, the implementation
and maintenance of occupational safety standards, and for projects with a minimum value of $1 Million, the employment of apprentices. The successful
Bidder must submit certifications of compliance with these laws from each of its subcontractors prior to their commencement of any work. Prevailing wage
rates, apprenticeship requirements, and other workforce and safety regulations are accessible at www _dit.ri.gov.

2.5. PUBLIC RECORDS. Offerors are advised that all materials submitted fo the State for consideration in response to this solicitation wilt be considered
without exception to be Public Records pursuant to Title 38 Chapter 2 of the Rhode Island General Laws, and will be released for inspection immediately
upon request once an award has been made. Offerors are encouraged to attend public bid/RFP openings to obtain information; however, bid/RFP response
summaries may be reviewed after award(s) have been made by using the RIVIP at any time or appearing in person at the Division of Purchases Mondays
through Fridays between 8:30 a.m. and 3:30 p.m. Telephone requests for results will not be honored. Written requests for results will only be honored if the
information is not available on the RIVIP.

SECTION 3 - AWARD DETERMINATION

Award will be made to the responsive and respensible offeror quoting the lowast net price in accordance with specifications, for any individual item(s), for
major groupings of items, or for all items listed, at the State’s sole option.

3.1. BID SURETY. Where bid surety is required, bidder must furnish a bid bond or certified check for 5% of the bid total with the bid, or for such other
amount as may be specified. Bids submitted without a required bid surety will not be considered.

3.2. SPECIFICATIONS. Unless specified "no substitute,” product offerings equivalent in quality and performance will be considered (at the sole option of the

State) on the condition that the offer is accompanied by detailed product specifications. Oiffers which fail to include alternate specifications may be deemed
nonresponsive.

SECTION 4 — CONTRACT PROVISIONS

4.1. VENDOR AUTHORIZATION TO PROCEED.

4.1A. When a purchase order, change order, contractfagreement or contract/agreement amendment is issued by the RI Division of Purchases, no claim for
payment for services rendered or goods delivered contrary to or in excess of the contract terms and scope shall be considered valid unless the vendor has
obtained a written change order or contract amendment issued by the Division of Purchases PRICR TO delivery.

4.1B. Any offer, whether in response to a solicitation for proposals or bids, or made without a sclicitation, which is accepted in the form of an order OR
Pricing Agreement made in writing by the Purchasing Agent, or a state official with purchasing authority delegated by the Purchasing Agent, shall be
considered a binding contract.
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4.2, REGULATIONS, GENERAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS GOVERNING STATE CONTRACTS. This solicitation and any contract ar purchase order
arising from it are issued in accordance with the specific requirements described herein, and the State’'s Purchasing Laws and Regulations and other
applicable State Laws. The Regulations, General Terms and Conditions are incorporated into all state contracts. These regulations and basic information
on How To Do Business with the State of Rhode Island are posted on the Rhode Island Vendor Information Program Website (www.purchasing.ri.gov).

4.2A. ARRA SUPPLEMENTAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS. Contracts and sub-awards funded in whole or in part by the American Recovery and
Reinvestment Act of 2008, Pub.L.No. 111-5 and any amendments thereto, such contracts and sub-awards, shall be subject to the Supplemental Terms and
Conditions For Contracts and Sub-awards Funded in Whole or In Part by the American Recovery and Reinvestment Act of 2009. Pub.L.No. 111-5 and any
amendments thereto located on the Division of Purchases website at www.purchasing.ri.gov.

4.3. EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY. Compliance certificate and agreement procedures will apply to all awards for supplies or services valued at
$10,000 and more. Minority Business Enterprise policies and procedures, including subcontracting opportunities as described in Title 37 Chapter 14.1, of
the Rhode Island General Laws, also apply.

4.4, PERFORMANCE BONDS. Where indicated, successful bidder must furnish a 100% performance bond and fabor and payment bond for contracts
subject to Title 37 Chapters 12 and 13 of the Rhode Island General Laws. All bonds must be furnished by a surety company authorized to conduct business
in the State of Rhode Island. Performance bonds must be submitted within 21 calendar days of the issuance of a tentative notice of award.

4.5. DEFAULT and NON-COMPLIANCE. Default andfor non-compliance with the RIVIP reguirements and any other aspects of the award may result in
withholding of payment(s), contract termination, debarment, suspension, or any other remedy necessary that is in the best interest of the state.

4.6. COMPLIANCE. Vendor must comply with all applicable federal, state and local laws, regulations and ordinances.

4.7. SPRINKLER IMPAIRMENT AND HOT WORK. The Contractor agrees to comply with the practices of the State's insurance carrier for sprinkler
impairment and hot work. Prior to performing any work, the Contractor shall obtain the necessary information for compliance from the Risk Management
Office at the Department of Administration or the agency for which work will be performed,

SECTION 5 — CERTIFICATIONS AND DISCLOSURES
ALL CONTRACT AWARDS ARE SUBJECT TO THE FOLLOWING DISCLOSURES & CERTIFICATIONS

Offerors must respond to every disclosure statement.
A person autherized to enter into contracts must sign the offer and attest to the accuracy of all statements.

Indicate Yes () or No (N):

.-b!_-_ 1. State whether your company, or any owner, steckholder, officer, director, member, partner, or principal thereof, or any subsidiary or affiliated
company, has been subject to suspension or debarmenti by any federal, state, or municipat government agency, or the subject of criminal
prosecution, or convicted of a criminal offense within the previous five (5) years. If so, then provide details befow.

2. State whether your company, or any owner, stockholder, officer, director, mernber, partner, or principal thereof, or any subsidiary or affiliated
company, has had any contracts with a federal, state or municipal government agency terminated for any reason within the previous five (5) years.
If s0, then provide details below.

3. State whether your company or any owner, stockholder, officer, director, member, partner, or principal thereof, or any subsidiary or affiliated
company, has been fined more than $5000 for violation(s) of Rhode Island environmental laws by the Rhode Istand Department of Environmental
Management within the previous five (5) years. if so, then provide details below.,

4, liwe certify that Hwe will immediately disclose, in writing, to the Chief Purchasing Officer any potential conflict of interest, which may occur during
the course of the engagement authorized pursuant to this contract.

5. I'we acknowledge that, in accordance with Chapter 37-2-54(c) of the Rhode Island General Laws “no purchase or contract shall be binding on the
state or any agency thereof unless approved by the Department [of Administration] or made under general regulations which the Chief Purchasing
Officer may prescribe”, including change orders and other types of contracts and under State Purchasing Regulation 8.2.1.1.2, “any alleged oral
agreement or arrangements made by a bidder or contractor with any agency or an employee of the Office of Purchases may be disregarded and
shall not be binding on the state”.

6. Iiwe cerify that l/we or myfour firm possesses all licenses required by Federal and State laws and regulations as they pertain to the requirements
of the solicitation and offer made herein and shall maintain such required license(s} during the entire course of the contract resuiting from the offer
contained herein and should my/our license lapse or be suspended, lwe shall immediately inform the Rhode Island State Purchasing Agent in
writing of such circumstance.

7. liwe certify that l'we will maintain required insurance during the entire course of the confract resulting from the offer contained herein and should
miy/our insurance lapse or be suspended, l'we shall immediately inform the Rhode Island State Purchasing Agent in writing of such circumstance.

8. iiwe certify that l/we understand that falsification of any information herein or failure to notify the Rhode Istand State Purchasing Agent as certified
herein may be grounds for suspension, debarment and/or prosecution for fraud.

9. l/we acknowledge that the provisions and procedures set forth in this form apply to any contract arising from this offer.

10. Hwe acknowledge that l/we understand the State’s Purchasing Laws (37-2 of the General Laws of Rhode Island} and Purchasing Regulations
and General Terms and Conditions available at the Rhode Island Division of Purchases Website (www.purchasing.ri.gov) apply as the governing
conditions for any contract or purchase order l/we may receive from the State of Rhode Island, including the offer contained harein.

11, |ANe certify that the bidder: (i) is not identified on the General Treasurer’s list, created pursuant to R.l. Gen. Laws § 37-2.5-3, as a person or entity
engaging in investment activities in Iran described in § 37-2.5-2(b); and {ii} is not engaging in any such investment activities in Iran,

12. Hwe certify that the above vendor information is correct and complete.
RIVIP Certification Form Page 3 of 4 Revised: 11/20/2013
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IF YOU HAVE ANSWERED “YES” TO QUESTIONS #1-3 OR IF YOU ARE UNABLE TO CERTIFY YES TO ITEMS #4-12 OF THE FOREGOQING,
PROVIDE DETAILS/EXPLANATION BELOW AND/OR IN AN ATTACHED STATEMENT. INCOMPLETE CERTIFICATION FORMS SHALL BE

GRQUNDS FOR DISQUALIFICATION OF OFFER.

Signature below commits vendor to the attached offer and certifies (1) that the offer has taken into account alf solicitation
amendments, {2) that the above statements and information are accurate and that vendor understands and has complied
with the requirements set forth herein. When delivering offers in person to One Capitol Hill, vendors are advised to allow at
least one hour additionaf time for clearance ugh security checkpoints.

%/J /KD Date L”'qulq

Vendor's Signature (fPerson author&éﬂ’o enter into contracts; signature must be in ink.)

FAANK STAMCO PRESIOENT Brint
Name and Title of company official sighing offer
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SOLICITATION TITLE: Replacement of Doors & Related Hardware, DOA
SOLICITATION NUMBER: 7548537

SOLICITATION SUBMISSION DEADLINE:  April 25, 2014 at 11:00 AM

PREBID CONFERENCE
0 YES - NONMANDATORY
O YES - MANDATORY weeesp Bidder must attend the mandatory prebid conference. The bidder’s

representative must register with the Division of Purchases at the mandatory
prebid conference and identify the bidder he or she represents.

Location:
Date:
Time: Choose an item.

QUESTIONS concerning this solicitation must be received by the Division of Purchases (at
construction@purchasing.ri.gov no later than 5:00 PM, April 14, 2014, Questions should be submitted in a Microsaoft
Word attachment. Please reference the solicitation number (7548537) on all correspondence. Questions received, if
any, will be posted on the Rhode Island Division of Purchases website as an addendum to this solicitation. It is the
responsibility of all interested parties to download this information,

BID BOND REQUIRED: O YES
X NO

PAYMENT AND PERFORMANCE BOND REQUIRED: [ YES
NO

SPECIFICATION AND PLAN FILES: [ YES: See Electronic Solicitation Bidding Information
NO

RIVIP REGISTRATION: Bidders must be registered vendors through the online Division of Purchases Rhiode Island
Vendor Information Program at www.purchasing.ri.gov. To register or update information, click on “Vendor Center,”
then “Vendor Information” from the dropdown menu on the left,

~ BIDDER CERTIFICATION COVER FORM: Bidders must download (obtainable at www.purchasing.ri.gov),
complete, and submit a Bidder Certification Cover Form with each bid proposal.

Buyer Name: John F, O’Hara I1, Title: Chief Buyer

2014-6 Revised: 1/26/2014




State of Rhode Island Department of Administration
Division of Purchases

REVISED
November 20, 2013

NOTICE TO VENDORS

Each bid proposal for a public works project must include a "public copy" to be available for public

inspection upon the opening of bids. Bid proposals that do not include a copy for public inspection
will be deemed nonresponsive.

The public copy must be submitted in .pdf (portable document file) format on a read-only CD-R media
disc. The disc must include all of the documents submitted in response to the solicitation concatenated or
merged into one file. The file must be named in the following manner:

BidNumber_DateofBid_VendorName_VendorID.pdf

The Bidder Certification Cover Form contains all of the information for the file name. The date of bid

must appear as mm-dd-yyyy. The vendor name must appear as one word, with no spaces or punctuation.
Underscores must separate the fields.

Example: 7543210_11-08-2013_OceanStateCompanylnc_9867.pdf

The public copy disc must be separately enclosed in a protective cover clearly marked “Public Copy” and
include the following information (all available from the Bidder Certification Cover Form): (1) title of
solicitation; (2) name of bidder and RIVIP vendor ID number; (3) bid number; and (4) date of bid.

The public copy may redact any trade secrets or commercial or financial information which is of a
privileged or confidential nature pursuant to the “Access to Public Records Act,” R. I. Gen. Laws §§ 38-
2-1 et seq.

For further information on how to comply with this statutory requirement, see R. 1. Gen. Laws §§ 37-2-
18(b) and (j). Also see Procurement Regulation 5.11 accessible at www.purchasing.ri.gov

2013-3 Revised 11-20-2013




ONE CAPITOL HILL
PROVIDENCE RI 02908

BUYER: Ohara2nd, JohnF

Request for Quote

STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

Page 1 of 4

CREATION DATE :

BID NUMBER:
TITLE:

03-MAR-14
7548537

Repiacerment of Deors & Related Hardware, DOA

BLANKET START :01-JUN-14

BLANKET END

: 31-MAY-17

PHONE #  401-574-8125 BID CLOSING DATE AND TIME:25-APR-2014 11:00:00
B 3
;_ gﬁfi‘ gggﬁ%?ﬁff £TH FLOOR :" DOA-FACILITIES MANAGEMENT
g FOR DESTINATION SEE BELOW
L | SMITHST P ow
PROVIDENGE, 02908 Us
T |uUs T
0 0
Requistion Number: 1352872
Line Description Quantfity Unit :;J:;lte Total
B.Ianket Requirement: June 1, 2014 - May 31, 2017

1 i ) X 4.00 Each

Hinge, Pair Stanley FBB -179, 4 1/2 x 4 1/2, US, prime, non 8D

removable pins NO ]
2 Hinge, Pair Stanley FBB 168, 4 1/2 x 4 1/2, HW, US, prime 1.00 kach

nen reravable pins, heavywelght No 810D
3 Hinge, Palr Stanley FBB -173, 4 1/2, Half Mortise w/ 1.00 Each

template holes NO 210
4 Hinge, Palr Stanley FBB -1173, 4 1/2, Half Surface w/ 100 Each

template holes No 81D
5 700 Each

Hinge, Roton, 7'0" w/ thru boits and covers . aC‘ t11. o q
6 LEVER PASSAGE SET - SCHLAGE ND SERIES 10S - 626 1.00 Each

ND 108 wWy.HT 144 . YT
7 1.00 Each

PRIVACY SET - SCHLAGE ND SERIES 408 e.04| lbb. 09
[ 3.00 Each

ENTRANCE SET - SCHLAGE ND SERIES 53PD 196 .74 “'Qﬁa_-—fq‘}_—s
9 1.00 Each

SPLIT ASTRAGEL, 7°0%, 351 X 351 No BID
0 1.00 Each

THRESHOLD - ALUMINUM, 3'0", OUT SWING, #2005A NG 81D
n CLOSURE - LON, PARALELL ARM #4411, ALUMINUM 3.00 Each

FINISH, W/COVER 178 .94| 529.47
12 2.00 Each

CLOSURE - LCN, HOLD OPEN ARM, CUSHION ARM,

ALUMINUM FINISH, W/COVER 226.i0l Y52.20
3 2.00 Each

KICK PLATE, 8 X 34", 18 GAUGE, STAINLESS STEEL 19 . ¢o 348, 0o
14 1.00 Each

EXIT DEVICE, RIM PANIC, VON DUPRIN 99EO-F 50¢.0| 569.60

560 .37

It Is the Vendor's responsibility to chack and download any and all addenda from the RIVIP. This offer may net be considered unless a signed
RIVIP generaled Bidder Cerlification Cover Form Is attached and the Unit Price column is completed. The signed Certification Cover Form must
be attached to the front of the offer



ONE CAPITOL HILL
PROVIDENCE R102908

Request for Quote

STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

Page 2 of 4

CREATION DATE: 03-MAR-14

BIDNUMBER: 7548537
TITLE: Replacement of Doors & Related Hardware, DOA

RiVIP generated Bidder Certification Cover Forin Is atlached and the Unit Price column is completed. The signed Certification Cover Form

be attached to the front of the offer

BUYER: Ohara 2nd, John F gtﬁ:ﬁg AL il
PHONE # 401-574-8125 : 31-MAY-
BID CLOSING DATE AND TIME:25-APR-2014 11:00:00
B 5
[ | boa conTROLLER H
DOA-FACILITIES MANAGEMENT
L | ONE CAPITOL HILL, 4TH FLOOR | | POR DESTINATION SEE BEL D1
L | smTHsT PR
PROVIDENCE, 02908 R
T |us T
0 0
Requistion Number: 1352972
Line Description Quantity Unit FL’ercl:te Tolal

15 1.00 Each

EXIT DEVICE, RIM PANIC, VON DUPRIN 99L-F 1852 185 .o
16 EXIT DEVICE, MORTISE PANIC, VON DUPRIN 100 Each -

9975E0-F-EQ 194 - 7194 .00
17 1.00 Each

EXIT DEVICE, MORTISE PANIC, VON DUPRIN 9975L-F 1610.60} 1010 . 00
18 1.00 Each

EXIT DEVICE, VERTICAL PANIC, VON DUPRIN, 8927 EO 128.®| 738 - o©
1o VISION LIGHT KIT - 4" X 25" W/UL WIRE GLASS, FOR 1.00 Each

USE W/LABELED WOOD DOOR No 8D
20 VISION LIGHT KIT - 4" X 25" W/UL WIRE GLASS, FOR 1.08 Each

USE W/LABELED METAL DOOR No &0
57 300 Each

WELDED FRAME - 3-0 X 7-0, 16 GAUGE NO B 1D
2 WELDED FRAME - 3-0 X 7-0, 14 GAUGE W/7 GAUGE 100 Each

HINGE REINFORCEMENTS NO BID
23 WELDED FRAME - 3-0 X 7-0, B LABELED W/HIGH 1.00 Each

FREQUENCY HINGE PREPARATIONS NO BID
5% 100 Each

B0 X7- BELED

WELDED FRAME - 6-0 X 7-0, A LABELE NGO 81D
25 METAL DOOR - 3-0 X 7-0, FLUSH, 18 GAUGE, 100 Fach

WICLOSURE REINFORCEMENT OF 14 GAUGE TUBES No 81D
26 METAL DOOR - 3-0 X 7-0, FLUSH, 18 GAUGE, CUSTOM 1.00 Each

UNIT, W/ 1/8" BEVEL EACH SIDE No 81D
2 METAL DOOR - PAIR 3-0 X 7-0, UNDERWRITERS B 1.00 Fach

LABEL. W/ 14 GAUGE STEEL CHANNELS No B D
28 METAL DOOR - PAIR 3-0 X 7-0, UNDERWRITERS A 100 Each '

LABEL, W/ 14 GAUGE STEEL CHANNELS N6 B8 1D
29 3.00 Each

WOOD DOOR - BIRGH, SOLID, 3-0 X 7-0, FLUSH, No BID

; fenda from thelRIVIP_This offer may not

bd

must



Request for Quote Page 3of 4

STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS
ONE CAPITOL HILL
PROVIDENCE RI 02908

CREATION DATE: 03-MAR-i4

BID NUMBER: 7548537
TITLE:  Raplacemsnt of Doors & Related Hardware, DOA

BUYER: Ohara 2nd, John F B ANKET T o
PHONE #  401-574-8125 : 31-MAY-17
BID CLOSING DATE AND TIME:25-APR-2014 11:00:00
B S
] gﬁé gg,’;ﬁgfl;hff 4TH FLOOR [H DOA-FACILITIES MANAGEMENT
' FOR DESTINATION SEE BELOW
L | SMITHST p | O
PROVIDENCE, 02908 A
T |us T
0 0
- Requistion Number; 1352972
: Unit
Line Description Quantity Unit Price Total
MACHINED
30 WOOD DOOR - BIRCH, 'B' LABELED, 3-0 X 7-0, FLUSH, 1.00 Each
MAGHINES, (PAIR MATCHED) NoRk D
31 WIRE GLASS - UL RATED, POLISHED, GEORGIAN 1.00 Each
SQUARE No BiD
2 WIRE GLASS - UL RATED, POLISHED, MISCO 1.00 Each
DIAGONAL No B P
73 INSTALLATION LABOR PER HOUR, ON SITE 52.00 Each NOGID
OTHER PARTS AT MANUFACTURER'S LIST
PRICE LESS PERCENTAGE, COMPLETE
BELOW:

(COST PLUS IS NOT ALLOWED).

FIRE RATED GLASS-KERALITE FR-F 90
MINUTE DISCOUNT MNJ[A o,

DISCOUNT FROM LIST-OSHKOSH. NJ A .

DISCOUNT FROM
LIST-STEELCRAFT N l A o,

DISCOUNT FROM LIST-PIONEER_N [A %,
DISCOUNT FROM LIST-ARROW N [ A 4,
DISCOUNT FROM LIST-SCHLAGE_21_
DISCOUNT FROM LIST-YALE. V[ A ¢,
DISCOUNT FROM LIST-PRECISION_H 8 %.
isT-RoCKWoOD_AIJA %,

DISCOUNT FROM LIST-PILKINSON _NA%.

DISCOUNT FROM LIST-SARGENT M Zﬁ %.
DISCOUNT FROM LIST-NORTON N | & .

X

It Is the Vendor's responsibllity to check and download any and all addenda from the RIVIP. This offer may not ba consldered unless a signed
RIVIP generated Bidder Cerlification Cover Form is attached and the Unit Price column is completed. The signed Certification Cover Eorm must
be aitached fo the front of the offer



Request for Quote Page 4 of 4

STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS
ONE CAPITOL HILL
PROVIDENCE RI 02508

CREATION DATE: 03-MAR-14

BIDNUMBER: 7548537
TITLE:  Replacement of Doors & Related Hardware, DOA

BUYER: Ohara 2nd, John F N RaRT £ D1-JUN-14
PHONE # 401.574-8125 TEND  : 31-MAY-17
BID CLOSING DATE AND TIME:25-APR-2014 11:00:00
B s
'L ooa ggﬁ?ﬁ?’;ﬁfﬁ ATH FLOOR :" DOA-FACILITIES MANAGEMENT
- FOR DESTINATION SEE BELOW
L | SMITHST P
PROVIDENCE, 02808 U
T [ US T
0 0
Requistion Number: 1352872
tUnit
Line Description Quantity Unit Price Total

DISCOUNT FROM LIST-PEMKO Nj A %
DISCOUNT FROM LIST-STANLEY_H 5 o,

DISCOUNT FROM LIST-CORBIN
RUSSWIN M Y.

DISCOUNT FROM LIST-VON
DUPRIN_52 %,

DISCOUNT FROM LIST-LCN_ 5%+,

T FROM LIST-D00R-AMATIC._ 2T 0.
DISCOUNT FROM LISTIVES_ 27+,

DISCOUNT FROM LIST-SPECIAL
LIGHT N ‘ & %.

DISCOUNT FROM LIST-SELECT_H & .

DISCOUNT FROM LIST-DECOLAN TOILET
PARTITIONS, PHENOCLIC, FLOOR MOUNTED,
OVERHEAD BRACED N!ﬂ Y.

DISCOUNT FROM LIST-BRADLEY
PARTITIONS, SOLID PLASTIC, FLOO
MOUNTED, OVERHEAD BRACED NIA %.

DISCOUNT FROM LIST-BRADLEY
PARTITIONS, METAL, FLOQR MOUNTED,
OVERHEAD BRACED_NJ A %,

Delivery: 1 5 DAMS Alo
Terms of Payment: __ /N ET30

it is the Vendor's responsibility to check and download any and all addenda from the RIVIP. This offer may not be cansidered unless a signed
RIVIP generated Bidder Certification Cover Form Is aftached and the Unit Price cofumn is completed. The signed Cerlification Cover Form must
be altached to the front of the offer




Department of Administration Tel: (401) 574-8100

DIVISION OF PURCHASES Fax: (401) 574-8387
One Capitol Hill Website: www.purchasing.ri.gov

Providence, RI 02908-5855

DIVISION OF PURCHASES
PUBLIC WORKS BID CLAUSES
(FOR SERVICE BIDS)

Offer to Contract

All bid proposals are subject to and constitute an offer to contract with the State
of Rhode Island through the Division of Purchases on the terms and conditions
contained in this solicitation, any addenda, applicable federal and municipal law,
and the laws of the State of Rhode Island, including all procurement statutes and
regulations (available at www.purchasing.ri.gov}, all of which are incorporated by
this reference into any confract awarded pursuant to this solicitation.

The terms and conditions in _these Division of Purchases Public Works Bid
Clauses supersede any and all inconsistent or conflicting terms and conditions in

any other provision of any other document in this_solicitation and shall govern
this solicitation and the award of any contract pursuant to this solicitation.

Noncompliance

Bidders must comply with all requirements. Any failure to comply may result, at
the discretion of the State Purchasing Agent, in the disqualification of the bid
proposal.

Failure of the successful bidder to comply with the terms and conditions of the
contract awarded pursuant to this solicitation may result in nonpayment,
termination of the confract, suspension or debarment of the bidder, or any other

necessary or appropriate remedy in the sole discretion of the State Purchasing
Agent.

2014-3 Page 1 of 7 Revised: 2/26/2014



Addenda

Bidders are responsible for checking for addenda, all of which become incorporated into
this solicitation upon posting on the Division of Purchases website at
www.purchasing.ri.gov. No addenda will be posted within the 5-day period preceding
the submission date for bid proposals.

Apprenticeship

The successful bidder must employ apprentices on this project (if the value of the
project is at least $1 Million) in accordance with the apprentice to journeyperson ratio for
each trade approved by the State Apprenticeship Council. Specific information is
available at www.dlt.ri.gov/apprenticeship.

Award

The State Purchasing Agent, in his or her sole discretion, will award the contract
pursuant to this solicitation to the responsive and responsible bidder who submits the
lowest responsive and responsible bid. A binding contract between the State of Rhode
island and the successful bidder will be formed only by the issuance of a Purchase
Order by the Division of Purchases.

Bid Proposal Submission

Each bid proposal (a complete package, with the signed Bidder Certification Cover
Form) must be submitted in a separafe sealed envelope with the specific “Bid Number”
and the “Submission Date and Time” marked in the upper left-hand corner of the
envelope.

The bid proposal must be delivered to the Division of Purchases (via mail or messenger
service) by the date and time specified for the submission of bid proposals. Bidders
should allow at least one hour additional time for parking and clearance through security
checkpoints when delivering a bid proposal in person or by messenger. Bids must be
addressed fo:

Rhode Island Department of Administration
Division of Purchases

One Capitol Hill, Second Floor
Providence, Rl 029808-5855

Bid proposals that are not present in the Division of Purchases at the date and time
specified for the submission of bid proposals for whatever reason will be deemed late
and will not be considered. The submission time will be determined by the time clock in
the Division of Purchases. Postmarks will not be considered proof of timely submission.
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Contractors Registration

The bidder must have and maintain a valid certificate of registration issued by the
Contractors’ Registration Board throughout the term of the contract awarded pursuant to
this solicitation and ensure that its subcontractors, unless exempt from registration, also
obtain and maintain valid certificates of registration.

Divestiture of Investments in Iran Reguirement

No bidder engaged in investment activities in [ran as described in R.l. Gen. Laws §37-
2.5-2(b) may submit a bid proposal to, or renew a contract with, the Division of
Purchases. Each bidder submitting a bid proposal or entering into a renewal of a
contract is required to certify that the bidder does not appear on the list maintained by
the General Treasurer pursuant to R.l.-Gen. Laws § 37-2.5-3.

Domestic Steel

Any steel products required by the plans and specifications in this solicitation must be
fabricated or processed from steel made in the United States.

Equal Opportunity

The successful bidder must demonstrate a commitment to equal opportunity and submit
an affirmative action plan for review by the State Equal Opportunity Office.

Foreign Corporations

No foreign corporation may transact business in the State of Rhode Island until it shall
have obtained a Certificate of Authority from the Rhode Island Secretary of State. The
successful bidder will be required to provide a Good Standing Certificate issued by the
Rhode Island Secretary of State within the 10-day period following the tentative letter of
award.

Inspection

The bidder is responsible for carefully reviewing all of the requirements of this
solicitation, inspecting the project site, including (without limitation) checking and/or
verifying measurements, site conditions, any limitations, and other details, prior to
preparing and submitting its bid proposal.
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Insurance

The successful bidder must submit a certificate of insurance that references the
solicitation number and names the State of Rhode Island as “certificate holder” and as
“additional insured” upon the issuance of the tentative letter of award, on an annual
basis during the term of the contract awarded pursuant to this solicitation, and from time
to time upon request.  The certificate of insurance must state that 20 days' advance
notice of cancellation will be sent to: Rhode Island Department of Administration,
Division of Purchases, One Capitol Hill, Providence, Rhode Island 02908-5855, fax #
401-574-8387, and provide evidence of the following specific types and amounts of
insurance:

Type of Insurance Amount of Coverage

Comprehensive General Liability

Bodily injury $1 Million each occurrence
$1 Million annual aggregate

Property damage $500,000 each occurrence
$500,000 annual aggregate

Independent contractors
Contractual (including construction “hold harmless” and other types of
Contracts or agreements in effect for insured operations)

Completed operations
Personal injury (with employee exclusion deleted)

Automobile Liability
Combined Single Limit $1 Million each occurrence

Bodily injury, property damage, including non owned and/or hired vehicles and
equipment

Workers Compensation
Coverage B $100,000

The State Purchasing Agent reserves the right to accept alternate forms and plans of
insurance and/or to required additional or more extensive coverage.
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Licenses

The successful bidder and anyone performing any work on the contract awarded
pursuant to this solicitation must possess all of the licenses required by any
governmental authority to perform such work.

Minority Business Enterprises

Respondents should be aware of all applicable MBE requirements, as set forth in R. I,
Gen. Law § 37-14.1-1, et seq. The State's goal is for a minimum ten per cent (10%)
participation by MBE's in all State procurements, For further information, contact the

State MBE Administrator at (401) 574-8253 or charles.newton@doa.ri.gov, Visit the
website http://iwww.mbe.ri.gov/

Occupational Safety

The successful bidder must ensure (if the total project cost is at least $100,000) that all
employees at the project site possess a card issued by the United States Department

of Labor certifying successful completion of an OSHA ten (10) hour construction safety
program.

Payment and Performance Bonds

The successful bidder must furnish a 100% payment and performance bond from a
surety licensed to conduct business in the State of Rhode Island upon the tentative
award of the contract,.

Prebid Conference

Bidders must attend a mandatory prebid conference and are encouraged to attend a
nonmandatory prebid conference. The bidder's representative must register with the

Division of Purchases at the mandatory prebid conference and identify the bidder he or
she represents.

Public Copy

Each bid proposal must include a "public copy" fo be available for public inspection
upon the opening of bids. For further information on how to comply with this statutory
requirement, see R. 1. Gen. Laws § 37-2-18(b), Procurement Regulation 5.11, and in
addition, for highway and bridge projects, also see Procurement Regulation 5.13,
accessible at www.purchasing.ri.gov.
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Reservation of Rights

The Division of Purchases reserves the right to revoke, suspend, or terminate this
solicitation at any time in its sole discretion.

Subcontractors

The bidder must demonstrate that it is able to perform a substantial portion of the work using its
own workforce. Any bidder that does not maintain a permanent workforce and/or proposes to
perform a disproportionate amount of the work through one or more subcontractors will be
considered unqualified. The Division of Purchases reserves the right to reject any such bid
proposal.

Substitutions

Products specified in this solicitation establish a standard of quality, performance,
dimension, function, and appearance. Proposed substitutions must meet the standard
and will not be considered without the prior written approval of the Division of
Purchases. A request for substitution must include the detailed information necessary
for a comprehensive evaiuation.

Taxes

The State of Rhode Island is exempt from federal excise taxes and state sales and use
taxes. The bidder shall not include such taxes in any prices in the bid proposal.

Termination

The Division of Purchases reserves the right to terminate any contract awarded
pursuant to this solicitation at any time, for any reason, with or without cause.
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Wages
For contracts that total less than $1 Million

The successful bidder and its subcontractors must pay their workers at the applicable
prevailing wage rates (for the various trades) on a weekly basis, pay one and one-half
times the applicable prevailing wage rates to any worker who works more than 40 hours
in any one week or more than 8 hours in any one day, and submit certified weekly
payroll forms on a monthly basis to the agency. Prevailing wage posters and rate
schedules, available at the Rhode Island Department of Labor and Training website at
www.dlt.ri.gov, must be posted at the project site.

For contracts that may total $1 Million or Greater

The successful bidder and its subcontractors must pay their workers at the applicable
prevailing wage rates for the various trades on a weekly basis, pay one and one-half
times the applicable prevailing wage rates to any worker who works more than 40 hours
in any one week or more than 8 hours in any one day, submit certified weekly payroll
forms on a monthly basis to the agency, and maintain (for contracts totaling $1 Million or
more) a certified prevailing wage daily log at the project site. Prevailing wage posters
and rate schedules, available at the Rhode Island Department of Labor and Training
website at www.dlt.ri.gov, must be posted at the project site.

Withdrawal

Bid proposals are irrevocable for a period of 60 days following the due date for their
submission,
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—— -Request-for Quotation-7548537

Terms and Conditions

BID STANDARD TERMS AND CONDITIONS

READING VENDOR NAMES ONLY

DUE TO LENGTH OF BID AND TIME CONSTRAINTS, THE STATE WILL ONLY
ACKNOWLEDGE RECEIPT AND READ THE NAMES OF VENDORS SUBMITTING PROPOSALS.
NO EXAMINATION OF DOCUMENTS OR PRESENTATION OF INFORMATION CONTAINED IN
PROPOSALS WILL BE MADE AVAILABLE AT THE BID OPENING; HOWEVER, INSTRUCTIONS
TO OBTAIN THE TABULATION OR SUMMARY OF BID RESPONSES WILL BE MADE
AVAILABLE AT THE RI DIVISION OF PURCHASES WEBSITE AT WWW .PURCHASING.RLGOV

WORK ORDER LIMITATIONS

IN NO EVENT WILL ANY INDIVIDUAL WORK ORDER EXCEED $5,000.00 WITHOUT PRIOR
APPROVAL OF THE OFFICE OF PURCHASES.

CHARGES PERMITTED

NO CHARGES OTHER THAN PARTS AND LABOR ON THE JOB - NO TRAVEL, NO MILEAGE,
NO MISCELLANEQUS CHARGES, NO PORTAL TO PORTAL.

AWARD

THE STATE, AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, SHALL RESERVE THE RIGHT TO MAKE ONE OR
MULTIPLE AWARDS FOR THIS REQUIREMENT AND/OR TO REJECT ANY OR ALL BIDS,
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n W-9

{Rev. January 2005)

Depariment of the Treasury
internal Revenue Service

Request for Taxpayer
Identification Number and Certification

Give form to the
requester, Do not
send to the IRS.

Name (as shown on your income tax return)

INDEPENDENT HARDWARE INC,

Business name, if different from above

Individual/
Check appropriate box: D Sole proprietor

Corporation

D Partnership D Other » . eio...

Exempt from backup
I:I withhalding

Address (number, street, and apt. or suite no.}

14 SOUTH FRONT STREET

Print or type

Requester's name and address (optional)

City, state, and ZIP code
PHILADELPHIA, PA 1810

List account number{s) here (optional)

See Specific instructions on page 2,

Taxpayer ldentification Number {TIN)

Enter your TIN in the appropriate box. The TIN provided must match the name given on Line 1 to avoid
backup withholding. For individuals, this is your social security number (SSN). However, for a resident 5
alien, sole proprietor, or disregarded entity, see the Part | instructions on page 3. For other entities, it is
your employer identification number (EIN}. If you do not have a number, see How fo get a TIN on page 3. or

Note. If the account Is in more than one name, see the chart on page 4 for guidelines on whose number

to enfer.

Social security number

|+ [+ 1] ]

Employer identification number

2|3l1|7|2[3|8]4]|5

E  Certification

Under penalties of perjury, | cerify that:

1. The number shown on this form is my correct taxpayer identification number {or 1 am waiting for a number to be issued to me), and

2. | am not subject to backup withholding because: (a) | am exempt from backup withholding, or (b} | have not been notified by the Internal
Revenue Service {RS) that | am subject to backup withhelding as a result of a failure to report all interest or dividends, or (c) the IRS has

notified me that [ am no longer subject to backup withholding, and

3. | am a U.S. person (including a U.S. resident alien).

Certification instructions. You must cross out item 2 above if you have been notified by the IRS that you are currently subject to backup
withholding because you have failed to report all interest and dividends on your tax return. For real estate transactions, item 2 does not apply.
For mortgage interest paid, acquisition or abandonment of secured property, cancellation of debt, contributions to an individual retirement

arrangement {IRA), and generally, payments
provide your correct TIN. (See the instructjghs gn page 4.) /?

than interest and dividends, you are not required to sign the Certification, but you must

Sign Signature of
Here 1.8, persen P

q{a4y ]y

Date »

=

S
Purpose of Form U

A person who is required to file an information return with the
IRS, must obtain your correct taxpayer identification number
(TIN} to report, for example, income paid to you, real estate
transactions, mortgage interest you paid, acquisition or
abandonment of secured property, cancellation of debt, or
contributions you made to an IRA.

U.S. person. Use Form W-9 only if you are a U.S. person
(including a resident alien), to provide your correct TIN to the
person requesting it (the requester) and, when applicable, to:

1. Certify that the TIN you are giving is correct (or you are
waiting for a number to be issued),

2. Certify that you are not subject to backup withholding,
or

3. Claim exemption from backup withholding if you are a
U.S. exempt payee.
Note, /f a requester gives you a form other than Form W-9 to
request your TIN, you must use the requester’s form if it is
substantially similar to this Form W-9.

For federal tax purposes you are considered a person if you
are:
# An individual who [s a citizen or resident of the United
States,
e A partnership, corporation, company, or association

created or organized in the United States or under the laws
of the United States, or

Cat, No, 10231X

IAO
=

® Any estate (other than a foreign estate) or trust. See
Regutations sections 301.7701-6(a) and 7(a) for additional
information,

Foreign person, If you are a foreign person, do not use
Form W-9. Instead, use the appropriate Form W-8 (see
Publication 515, Withholding of Tax on Nonresident Aliens
and Foreign Entities).

Nonresident alien who becomes a resident alien.
Generally, only a nonresident alien individual may use the
terms of a tax treaty to reduce or eliminate U.S. tax on
certain types of income. However, most tax treaties contain a
provision known as a “saving clause.” Exceptions specified
in the saving clause may permit an exemption from tax to
continue for certain types of income even after the recipient
has otherwise become a U.S. resident alien for tax purposes.

if you are a U.S. resident alien who is relying on an
exception contained in the saving clause of a tax treaty to
claim an exemption from U.S. tax on certain types of income,
you must attach a statement to Form W-8 that specifies the
following five items:

1. The treaty country. Generally, this must be the same
treaty under which you claimed exemption from tax as a
nonresident alien.

2. The treaty article addressing the income.

3. The article number (or location) in the tax treaty that
contains the saving clause and its exceptions.

Form W-9 (Rev. 1-2005



Lincoln B. Chafee
Governoy

Charles J. Fogarty

STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

Department of Labor and Training
Center General Complex

1511 Pontiac Avenue TTY: Via RI Relay 711

Cranston, RI 02520-4407

STATE CONTRACT ADDENDUM

RHODE ISLAND DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND TRAINING

PREVAILING WAGE REQUIREMENTS
(37-13-1 ET SEQ.)

The prevailing wage requirements are generally set forth in RIGL 37-13-1 et seq. These
requirements refer to the prevailing rate of pay for regular, holiday, and overtime wages
to be paid to each crafismen, mechanic, teamster, laborer, or other type of worker
performing work on public works projects when state or municipal funds exceed one
thousand dollars ($1,000),

Submit to the Awarding Authority a list of the contractor's subcontractors for any
part or all of the prevailing wage work in accordance with RIGL § 37-13-4;

. Pay all prevailing wage employees at least once per week and in accordance with

RIGL §37-13-7 (see Appendix B attached);

. Post the prevailing wage rate scale and the Department of Labor and Training's

prevailing wage poster in a prominent and easily accessible place on the work site
in accordance with RIGL §37-13-11; posters may be downloaded at
www.dlt.ri.gov/pw/Posters.htm .poster/htm or obtained from the Department of Labor
and Training, Center General Complex, 1511 Pontiac Avenue, Cranston, Rhode
Island;

Access the Department of Labor and Training website, at www.dlt.ri.gov on or
before July 1stof each year, until such time as the contract is completed, to
ascertain the current prevailing wage rates and the amount of payment or
contributions for each covered prevailing wage employee and make any necessary
adjustments to the covered employee's prevailing wage rates effective July Ist of
each year in compliance with RIGL §37-13-8;

. Attach a copy of this CONTRACT ADDENDUM and its attachments as a

binding obligation to any and all contracts between the contractor and any

An Equal Opportunity Employer/Program./Auxiliary aids and services are available upon request to individuals with disabilities,

2013-17

ITY via RI Relay 711
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STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

Department of Labor and Training

Center General Complex Telephone; (401} 462-8000

1511 Pontiac Avenue TTY: Via RI Relay 711
Cranston, RT 02920-4407

Lincoln D, Chafee
Governor

Charles J. Fogarty
Dlrector

subcontractors and their assignees for prevailing wage work performed pursuant
to this contract;

6. Provide for the payment of overtime for prevailing wage employees who work in
excess of eight (8) hours in any one day or forty (40) hours in any one week as
provided by RIGL §37-13-10;

7. Maintain accurate prevailing wage employee payroll records on a Rhode Island
Certified Weekly Payroll form available for download at
www.dlt.ri.gov/pw.forms/htm, as required by RIGL §37-13-13, and make those
records available to the Department of Labor and Training upon request;

8. Furnish the fully executed RI Certified Weekly Payroll Form to the awarding
authority on a monthly basis for all work completed in the preceding month.

9. For general or primary contracts one million dollars ($1,000,000) or more, shall
maintain on the work site a fully executed RI Certified Prevailing Wage Daily
Log listing the confractor's employees employed each day on the public works
site; the RI Certified Prevailing Wage Daily Log shall be available for inspection
on the public works site at all times; this rule shall not apply to road, highway, or
bridge public works projects. Where applicable, furnish both the Rhode Istand
Certified Prevailing Wage Daily Log together with the Rhode Island Weekly
Certified Payroli to the awarding authority.

10. Assure that all covered prevailing wage employees on construction projects with a
total project cost of one hundred thousand dollars ($100,000) or more has a

OSHA ten (10) hour construction safety certification in compliance with RIGL §
37-23-1;

11. Employ apprentices for the performance of the awarded contract when the
contract is valued at one million dollars (§1,000,000) or more, and comply with
the apprentice to journeyperson ratio for each trade approved by the
apprenticeship council of the Department of Labor and Training in compliance
with RIGL §37-13-3.1;

12. Assure that all prevailing wage employees who perform work which requires a
Rhode Island trade license possess the appropriate Rhode Island trade license in
compliance with Rhode Island law; and

An Equal Opportunity Employer/Program, /Auxiliary aids and services are available upon request to individuals with disabilities,
TTY via Rf Relay 711
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STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

Department of Labor and Training

Center General Complex Telephone:  (401) 462-8000

1511 Pontiac Avenue TTY: Via RI Relay 711
Cranston, RT 02920-4407

Linceln Ix. Chafee
Governor

Charles J. Fogarty
Director

13. Comply with all applicable provisions of RIGL §37-13-1, et. seq;
Any questions or concerns regarding this CONTRACT ADDENDUM should be
addressed to the contractor or subcontractor's attorney. Additional Prevailing Wage

information may be obtained from the Department of Labor and Training at
www.dlt.ri.gov/pw.

CERTIFICATION

I hereby certify that I have reviewed this CONTRACT ADDENDUM and
understand my obligations as stated above.

By: _FRANW STancCo

Title: PAESIOENT

Subscribed and sworn before me this Z¥_day of AYAML, 20tY

Notary Public 'V
My commission expires: ?‘311&

NOTARIAL SEAL
VINCENT CAMPAGNA
Notary Public
CiTY OF PHILADELPHIA.PHELADELPH!A 0104UNTY
My Gommission Expires Aug 31, 20

An Equal Opportunity Employer/Program, /Auxiliary aids and services are available upon request to individunls with disabilities.
TTY via RI Relay 711
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STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLA NTATIONS

Department of Labor and Training

Center General Complex Telephone:  (401) 462-8000
1511 Pontlac Avenue

Cranston, Ri 02920-4407

APPENDIX A

TITLE 37
Public Property and Works

CHAPTER 37-13
Labor and Payment of Debts by Contractors

SECTION 37-13-5

§37-13-5 Payment for trucking or materials furnished - Withholding of sums
due. -A contractor or subcontractor on public works anthorized by a proper authority
shall pay any obligation or charge for trucking and material which have been furnished
for the use of the contractor or subcontractor, in connection with the public works being
petformed by him or her, within ninety (90) days after the obligation or charge is incurred
or the trucking service has been performed or the material has been delivered to the site
of the work, whichever is later. When it is brought to the notice of the proper authority in
acity or town, or the proper authority in the state having supervision of'the contract, that
the obligation or charge has not been paid by the contractor or subcontractor, the proper
authority may deduct and hold for a period not exceeding sixty (60) days, from sumns of
money due to the contractor or subcontractor, the equivalent amount of such sums
certified by a trucker or materialman creditor as due him or her, as provided in this
section, and which the proper authority determines is reasonable for trucking performed
or materials furnished for the public works.
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APPRENDIX B

TITLE 37
Public Property and Works

CHAPTER 37-13
Labor and Payment of Debts by Contractors

SECTION 37-13-7

§37-13-7 Specification in contract of amount and frequency of payment of wages.
-(a) Bvery call for bids for every contract in excess of one thousand dollars ($1,000), to
which the state of Rhode Island or any political subdivision thereof or any public agency
orquasi-public agency is a party, for construction, alteration, and/or repair, including
painting and decorating, of public buildings or public works ofthe state of Rhode Isiand
orany political subdivision thereof, or any public agency or quasi-public agency and
which requires or involves the employment of employees, shall contain a provision
stating the minimum wages to be paid various types of employees which shall be based
upon the wages that will be determined by the director of labor and training to be
prevailing forthe corresponding types of employees employed on projects of a character
similar to the contract work in the city, town, village, or other appropriate political
subdivision of the state of Rhode Island in which the work isto be performed. Every
contract shall contain a stipulation that the contractor or his or her subcontractor shall pay
all the employees employed directly upon the site of the work, unconditionally and not
less often than once a week, and without subsequent deduction or rebate on any account,
the full amounts accrued at time of payment computed at wage rates not less than those
stated in the call for bids, regardless of any contractual relationships which may be
alleged to exist between the contractor or subcontractor and the employees, and that the
scale of wages to be paid shall be posted by the contractor in a prominent and easily
accessible place at the site of the work; and the further stipulation that there may be
withheld from the contractor so much of the accrued payments as may be considered
necessary to pay to the employees employed by the contractor, or any subcontractor on
the work, the difference between the rates of wages required by the contract to be paid
the employees on the work and the rates of wages received by the employees and not
refunded to the contractor, subcontractors, or their agents.

(b) The terms "wages", "scale of wages", "wage rates”, "minimum wages", and
"prevailing wages" shall include:

(1) The basic hourly rate of pay; and
(2) The amount of:
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(A) The rate of contribution made by a contractor or subcontractor to a trustee or to a
third person pursuant to a fund, plan, or program; and

(B) The rate of costs to the contractor or subcontractor which may be reasonably
anticipated in providing benefits to employees pursuant to an enforceable commitment to
carry out a financially responsible plan or program which was communicated in writing
to the employees affected, for medical or hospital care, pensions on retirement or death,
compensation for injuries or illness resulting from occupational activity, or insurance to
provide any of the foregoing, for unemployment benefits, life insurance, disability and
sickness insurance, or accident insurance, for vacation and holiday pay, for defraying
costs of apprenticeship or other similar programs, or for other bona fide fringe benefits,
but only where the contractor or subcontractor is not required by other federal, state, or
local law to provide any of the benefits; provided, that the obligation of a contractor or
subcontractor to make payment in accordance with the prevailing wage determinations of
the director of labor and training insofar as this chapter of this title and other acts
incorporating this chapter of this title by reference are concerned may be discharged by
the making of payments in cash, by the making of contributions of a type referred to in
subsection (b)(2), or by the assumption of an enforceable commitment to bear the costs of
a plan or program of a type referred to in this subdivision, or any combination thereof,
where the aggregate of any payments, contributions, and costs is not less than the rate of
pay described in subsection (b)(1) plus the amount referred to in subsection (b)(2).

(¢) The term "employees", as used in this section, shall include employees of
contractors or subcontractors performing jobs on various types of public worlks including
mechanics, apprentices, teamsters, chauffeurs, and laborers engaged in the transportation
of gravel or fill to the site of public works, the removal and/or delivery of gravel or fill or
ready-mix concrete, sand, bituminous stone, or asphalt flowable fill from the site of
public works, or the transportation or removal of gravel or fill from one location to
another on the site of public works, and the employment of the employees shall be
subject to the provisions of subsections (a) and (b).

(d) The terms "public agency" and "quasi-public agency” shall include, but not be
limited to, the Rhode Island industrial recreational building authority, the Rhode Island
economic development corporation, the Rhode Island airport corporation, the Rhode
Island industrial facilities corporation, the Rhode Island refunding bond authority, the
Rhode Island housing and mortgage finance corporation, the Rhode Island resource
recovery corporation, the Rhode Island public transit authority, the Rhode Island student
loan authority, the water resources board corporate, the Rhode Island health and
education building corporation, the Rhode Island higher education assistance authority,
the Rhode Island turnpike and bridge authority, the Narragansett Bay water quality
management district commission, Rhode Island telecommunications authority, the
convention center authority, the board of governors for higher education, the board of
regents for elementary and secondary education, the capital center commission, the
housing resources commission, the Quonset Point-Davisville management corporation,
the Rhode Island children's crusade for higher education, the Rhode Island depositors
economic protection corporation, the Rhode Island lottery commission, the Rhode Island

Page6of7 9-12-2013



partnership for science and technology, the Rhode Island public building authority, and
the Rhode Island underground storage tank board.
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